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Read through the 
introduction and select 
“Apply Online Now” 
when ready. 

Review the opening 
important information 
and select “Begin 
Application” when 
done. 
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For the type of legal 
structure, select “View 
Additional Types, 
Including Tax-Exempt 
and Governmental 
Organizations” and 
continue. 

Choose “Other Non-
Profit/Tax-Exempt 
Organizations” and 
continue. 



Applying for your Kiwanis Club’s EIN 
(IRS Form SS-4) 

 

  

Read and continue. 

For reason why EIN is 
being requested, 
select “Started a New 
Business” and 
continue. 
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Enter the name and 
social security number 
of the member of your 
club selected as being 
responsible to apply 
for the club’s 
Employee 
Identification Number 
and continue. (Note: 
Kiwanis recommends 
this person either be 
the club treasurer or 
club president.) 

Enter the official 
address for your club; 
this can be a 
permanent contact 
address for your club, 
or an officer’s address. 
List a primary contact 
number and name as 
well. If you want 
information regarding 
your EIN mailed to a 
different address, 
selectd “Yes”; 
otherwise select “No” 
and continue. 
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Confirm that your 
address is listed 
correctly; if you need 
to make changes, 
select “Edit Mailing 
Address”; otherwise, 
select “Accept as 
Entered”. 

Enter your club’s 
official name and 
organization date as 
listed on its new club 
information sheet or 
charter certificate and 
the county and state in 
which it’s officially 
established. Once 
done, continue. 
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Select “No” to the five 
questions regarding 
your club: owning a 
highway motor vehicle 
with a taxable gross 
weight of 55,000 lbs.; 
regarding 
gambling/wagering; 
regarding the need to 
file Form 720; 
regarding selling or 
manufacturing alcohol, 
tobacco, or firearms; 
or regarding having 
employees who will 
receive a W-2 form; 
and continue. 

For the purpose of 
your organization, 
select “Other” and 
continue. (See next 
page.) 
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Choose “Other”, enter 
“Community Service” 
and continue. 
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Choose which method 
you would like to 
receive your EIN 
(Kiwanis suggests 
receiving it by email 
for quicker notification) 
and continue. 

Read carefully over all 
information entered; 
when you are certain it 
is complete and 
correct, select 
“Submit”. 
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